
CONTACT (/CONTACT) 

BECOME A PCCA INSTRUCTOR 

(HTTPS://DOCS.GOOGLE.COM/FORMS/D/E/lFAIPQLSEGGM_vCQC9XAMCIQYWPG5ACWFF9F_YK9BQCHIK_IATQGAMWQNIEWFORM? 

USP=SF _LINK) 

jjl LOGIN (/USER?DESTINATION=NODE/14150) (? NOT A MEMBER? REGISTER (/USER/REGISTER) ~ SHOPPING CART (/CART) (0) 

(/) 

2018 IRC UPDATE PUBLICATION FOR PA 
HOME (/) • 2018 IRC UPDATE PUBLICATION FOR PA 

This publication is being provided as a public service by the Pennsylvania Construction Codes Academy. 

Properly applying and enforcing adopted building codes in Pennsylvania can be quite challenging, especially the 

International Residential Building Code. 

To address this challenge, the enclosed publication is designed to help the reader clearly understand how to properly 

apply and enforce the 2018 International Residential Code in Pennsylvania. 

The /RC code book cannot be read and enforced "as is". There are MANY changes that have been made that delete or 

modify numerous sections of the 2018 International Residential Code - based on decisions of the Uniform Construction 

Code Review and Advisory Council, as well as numerous legislative exclusions and exemptions that are incorporated 

into the Uniform Construction Code based on bills passed by the state legislature and signed into law by governors 

back to 2001. 

We hope this publication helps to make your job enforcing the 2018 /RC less confusing and more effective. 

It is designed to help the reader clearly understand how to properly apply and enforce the 2018 International 

Residential Code in Pennsylvania. 

The IRC code book cannot be read and enforced "as is". There are MANY changes that have been made that delete or 

modify numerous sections of the 2018 International Residential Code - based on decisions of the Uniform Construction 

Code Review and Advisory Council, as well as numerous legislative exclusions and exemptions that are incorporated 

into the Uniform Construction Code based on bills passed by the state legislature and signed into law by governors 

back to 2001. 

The 2018 International Residential Code was adopted by regulation on February 14, 2022 and took effect 

immediately, unless a permit applicant produces a contract for design or construction, signed before February 14th 

and submitted with a permit application no later than 6 months after the date of adoption of the regulations. 

The content in this publication is based on the assumption that the 2018 International Residential Code is adopted, as 

printed, unless a change is noted in this publication. 

· ~'2,'o'2,~l:.£1i:l"~h~kl\1~~NT (HTTPS://WWW.PACONSTRUCTIONCODESACADEMY.ORG/FLOODPLAIN-MANAGEMENT) 

ENERGY CODE RESOURCES (/ENERGY-CODE-RESOURCES-AND-TRAINING) ENERGY RESILIENCE (/ENERGY-RESILIENCE-RESOURCES) 



CON"fl,l!gil!Wtlw~:kclusions and exemptions 

BEfOt,f~/Mlt'i&ll1-?ifl1:'tt5iW~rom Section 403.62 of the UCC Administrative and Enforcement Requlatians 
(HTTPS://Dp~S.GOOGL.E.COMJFORMS/,D/E/1FAIPQLSE<;iGMYCQC9XI\MCIQYWPGSACWFF9F_YK9BQCHIK_IATQGAMWQNIEWFORM? 
us°r=/#'isWil?ns of the UCC Review and Advisory Council: 

,Iii LOGIN (/U9ERl£lEMW.q:\~i;lt~t:i00l'4:P.KJllVisiorW'N~IJi\~!l~"l!.1:\1:(JOOM~~clmQl.1ernatil!I" ~15i<M;, CART (/CART) (0) 

o To modify provisions in the 2018 IRC 

o To replace language in the 2018 IRC with language from the 2015 IRC 

(/) o To replace language in the 2018 IRC with language from the 2009 IRC 

o To replace language in the 2018 IRC with language from the 2021 IRC 

o To replace language in the 2018 IRC with modifications ta the 2015 IRC 

General exclusion (deletion of all references to residential alterations and repairs) 

As a result of Act 92 of 2004, incorporated into the regulations at 403.1 (b) 8 and 403.1. (b)9, all repairs and 

alterations to an existing residential dwelling are excluded from the uniform construction code -the residential code 

does not apply to such provisions, unless a municipality has a lawfully adopted ordinance that would require permits, 

inspections and compliance for some or all residential alterations and repairs. 

The exclusion does not apply to structural alterations. 

Recognized religious sect exclusion 

For single family dwellings of members of recognized religious sects who have obtained an exclusion from the building 

code official: 

Plumbing provisions are excluded 

Electrical provisions are excluded 

Lumber and wood provisions are excluded (but not related to pressure treated lumber) 

Delete all references ta LP or propane gas in Chapter 24 Fuel Gas. 

All aspects af LP and Propane Gas installations in Pennsylvania are superseded by the Pennsylvania Propane and LP 

Gas Act. No municipality may regulate any aspect of LP or Propane Gas installations. 

R101.2 Scope 

Delete reference to "alteration" and "repair" - Act 92 exclusion 

R102.7.1 Additions, alteration or repairs 

Delete references to "alterations" and "repairs" - Act 92 exclusion 

R105.1 Permits Required 

Delete references to "alterations and repairs" -Act 92 exclusion 

R105.2 Work exempt from permit 

FLOODPLAIN MANAGEMENT (HTTPS://WWW.PACONSTRUCTIONCODESACADEMY.ORG/FLOODPLAIN-MANAGEMENT) 
ENERGY CODE RESOURCES (/ENERGY-CODE-RESOURCES-AND-TRAINING) ENERGY RESILIENCE (/ENERGY-RESILIENCE-RESOURCES) 



C~tlH~lff§~)Administrative and Enforcement regulations found at 403.62 
BECOME A PCCA INSTRUCTOR 
(l"!TTPS://DOCS.GOOGLSCOM/FORMS/D/E/1FAIPQLSEGGM_VCQC9XAMCIQYWPG5ACWFF9F_YKSBQCHIJUATQGAMWQNIEWFORM? 

Bljj'5/i);l;!c_l
1
Nijetacheu private garages, greenhouses, carports and sheds less than 1000 square teet in building area 

Q11\lrn;11it9d~d~~.iii1b1i1looJi;,Q<I~~~ory to§i119m-wmi/joofl(\l.!lfEA~Al>1rui9ltm\m all lJ!!!Cltsiil~l>l'llllll:!<:kJ,~fl:~%iJRC 

Building 2 -Fences 6 feet or less are exempt from permit, not 7 as stated in the IRC. 

(/) 
Building 10 - Decks less than 30" above grade around the entire perimeter and that have no roof or covering are _ 

exempt from compliance with the UCC and IRC. 

Plumbing 1 - Delete completely - Act 92 exclusion 

Plumbing 2 - Delete completely-Act 92 exclusion 

R105.2.1 Emergency Repairs 

Delete subsection -Act 92 exclusion 

R105.2.2 Repairs 

Delete subsection - Act 92 exclusion 

R302.5.1 Opening Protection [Delete this section in the 2018 IRC and replace it with this section from the 2009 IRq: 

■ Openings from a private garage directly into a room used for sleeping purposes shall not be permitted. 

■ Other openings between the garage and residence shall be equipped with solid wood doors not less than 1-3/8 

inches (35 mm) in thickness, solid or honeycomb core steel doors not less than 1-3/8 inches (35 mm) thick, or 

20-minute fire-roted doors 

■ (No requirement in 2009 IRC for self-closing door) 

R302.13 Fire Protection of Floors [Delete this section in the 2018 IRC and replace it with the prescriptive language 

found in Act 1 of 2011): 

901(h) Fire protection of floors. --

(1) Except as set forth in paragraph (2), a floor assembly not required in the International Residential Code, or its 

successor building code, to be fire-resistance rated shall be provided with a 1/2-inch gypsum wallboard membrane, 

5/8-inch wood structural panel membrane, or equivalent, on the underside of the floor framing member. 

(2) Paragraph (1) shall not apply to any of the following: 

(i) A floor assembly located directly over a space protected by an automatic sprinkler system in accordance with 

section P2904, NFPA13D or other equivalent sprinkler system approved by a municipal code official. 

ENERGY CODE RESOURCES (/ENERGY-CODE-RESOURCES-AND-TRAINING) ENERGY RESILIENCE (/ENERGY-RESILIENCE-RESOURCES) 



(iii~()llfj6<§llt!/00tlf~or assembly which complies with all of the following: 
BECOME A PCCA INSTRUCTOR 
(HTTPS://DOCS.GOOGLE.COM/fORMS/D/E/1FAIPQLSEGGMYCQC9X,I\MCIQYWPG5ACWFF9F_YK9BQCHIIUATQGAMWQNIEWFORM? 

(AIJslbSF'l'ilWfgate area ot the unprotected portions shall not exceed 80 square feet per story. 

'1, LOGIN (/USER?DESTINATION=NODE/14150) {? NOT A MEMBER? REGISTER (/USER/REGISTER) l!! SHOPPING CART (/CART) (0) 

(Bl Fire blocking in accordance with section R302.11.1 shall be installed along the perimeter of the unprotected 

portion to separate the unprotected portion from the remainder of the floor assembly. 

(/) 
(iv) A wood floor assembly using dimension lumber or structural composite lumber equal to or greater than two-inell 

by ten-inch nominal dimension or a floor assembly approved by a municipal code official demonstrating equivalent fire 

performance. 

((h) added April 25, 2011, P.L.1, No.1) 

Replace the following sections in the 2018 \RC and replace them with these prescriptive requirements found at 403.21 

(a)(7) (A-F) in Chapter 403 af the UCC regulations, based on Act 13 of 2004 amending the Pennsylvania Construction 

Code Act: 

Delete this portion of Section R311.7.2 Headroom 

Tl 1e l;eadrooi,, i1, 3'1:ai1 .JVeJ)'3 3l=iall be r,et less ti 101; G feet 8 i11cl 1e3 1T1ea3urcd ve1 tieall)' 

ft 011, ti ,e 3ler:,cd Iii ,e aeijei1 .i1 ,g ti 1c t1 ead 11e3ing 01 f101, 1 ti ,c floe1 surioee of ti ,e leu 1di1 •'ti 01 plotfot 11"1 011 trlat 1501 tiot I of 

the 3tait vvoy. 

AND 

Delete this portion of Section R311. 7 .1 Width 

Stoi1 0vay3 3110II be 1 ,at less ti 101, 36 ii ,cl ,cs i11 elca1 uvidtl, at all poi11t3 obove ti 1e pe111 iitted I 101 ,eh ail I ,eight 011d below 

Replace with: 

Stairways may not be less than 3 feet in clear width and clear headroom of 6 feet 8 inches shall be maintained for the 

entire run of the stair 

Delete this portion of section R311.7.5.1 

Tl 1e I i3e1 I ,cigl 1t sl ,all be 1,ot 1,,01 e ti 101, 73/4 i1 ,el ,eJ (1961111 n). Tl 1c I ise1 sl 1011 be 111ea3u1 cd vet tieally bctvocc11 leadi119 

ed9c3 of ti 1c adjoee1 ,t t1 ead3. Tl ,e 91 cate3t I i3c1 I 1ci9I ,t ooitl ,it I a11'.9 fli9I ,t of 3tai13311all 1,ot C:.{eecel ti Ic 31, 1olle3t by 11,01 e 

ti 1011 JfO ii 1el I 

Replace with: 

FLOODPLAIN MANAGEMENT (HTTPS://WWW.PACONSTRUCTIONCODESACADEMY.ORG/FLOODPLAIN-MANAGEMENT) 

ENERGY CODE RESOURCES (/ENERGY-CODE-RESOURCES-AND-TRAINING) ENERGY RESILIENCE (/ENERGY-RESILIENCE-RESOURCES) 



Tli<fllii<J!\iiifri.ffi¥,NliAel'lheight is 8 1/4 inches. There may be no mare than a 3/8-inch variation in riser height within a flight 

oflj/\\j~Eft-f,f~li;ltf~½'h1i9~ to be measured vertically between leadinq edqes of the adjacent treads. 
(HTTPS://DOCS.GOOGLEfOM/FORMS/D/E/1FAIPQLSEGGM_VCQC9XAMCIQYWPG5ACWFF9F_YK98QCHIKJATQGAMWQNIEWFORM? 
USP=SF _LINK) 

lilel~itll,ill~Rri!lm~S~i;iorffi\.:li1.i\15.2 ($' NOT A MEMBER? REGISTER (/USER/REGISTER) ~ SHOPPING CART (/CART) (0) 

The treed dei,itl. sl,ell be Aet less tl.e1, 10 iAel,es). Tl.e t1 eed dei,itl, sl ,ell be 111ees~1'ed I ,et izeAtelly beto,een ti ,e ve1 tieel er 1,e3 of ti ,c fOFCfl10:3t 131 ejeetioI, of aeljoee11t treads a1'"ld at a I igl 1t ell 19le to ti ,e t1•ead'3 leadi119 ed9c. Tl;c 91•eerl:cst 

t1eael dc15tl, vvithi1, aI ,y fli9l 1t of stai1 :s JI 1all I1ot oeeced ti ,c 311 ,ellest by 11101 c ti 1ai, 3/8 i1 ,eh 

Replace with: 

The minimum tread depth is 9 inches measured from tread nosing to tread nosing. The greatest tread depth within 

any flight af stairs may not exceed the smallest by more than 3/8 inch. 

(D) Treads may have a uniform projection of not more than 11/2 inches when solid risers are used. 

(E) 

Delete this portion of Section R311.7.8.2 

I ler,dfelils sl 10ll 1,ot pI e,jeet 11101•e that, 41/2 iRelie3 01, citl 1c1 side of the 3tai1 vveiy. 

Replace with: 

Handrails may project from each side of a stairway a distance of 3 1/2 inches into the required width of the stair 

Section R311.7.4 Walk Line 

The PA UCC RAC amended this section by ADDING Figure R311.7.4 for clarification 

WIDEST C\,EAR 
STAIRWlbTH 

Fig. A 

FLOODPLAIN MANAGEMENT (HTTPS://WWW.PACONSTRUCTIONCODESACADEMY.ORG/FLOODPLAIN-MANAGEMENT) 
ENERGY CODE RESOURCES (/ENERGY-CODE-RESOURCES-AND-TRAINING) ENERGY RESILIENCE (/ENERGY-RESILIENCE-RESOURCES) 



RJ::m!l!'-Qhll!:qtljilil'J:TlNo-Family Dwellings Automatic Fire Sprinkler Systems [Delete this section in the 2018 IRC and 

re~M'ff Witir~~s,:q.i~/iWtive lanquaqe in Act 1 of 20111: 
(HTTPS://DOCS.GOOGLE.Co'M!FORMS/D/E/lFAIPQLSEGGM_vcQC9XAhACIQYWPG5ACWFF9F_YK9BQCHIK_IATQGAMWQNIEWFDRM? 

USP=SF _LINK) 

Q LOGIN (/USER?DESTINATION=NODE/14150) (? NOT A MEMBER? REGISTER (/USER/REGISTER) l!l SHOPPING CART (/CART) (0) 

901(g) Automatic fire sprinkler systems in one-family and two-family dwellings. --

(/) 

(1) Section R313.2 (relating to one- and two-family dwellings automatic fire sprinkler systems) of the International 

Residential Code (2009 edition), and any successor triennial revisions, is excluded from this act and shall not be part of 

Chapter 3. 

Section R314.4 Interconnection of Smoke Alarms [Delete this section in the 2018 IRC and replace it with this section 

from the 2015 IRC, along with the exception which is as a result of a PA Legislative Amendment]: 

■ Where more than one smoke alarm is required to be installed within an individual dwelling unit in accordance 

with Section R314.3, the alarm devices shall be interconnected in such a manner that the actuation of one 

alarm will activate all of the alarms in the individual dwelling unit. 

■ Physical interconnection of smoke alarms shall not be required where listed wireless alarms are installed and all 

alarms sound upon activation of one alarm. 

■ The provisions of R 314.4 requiring interconnected smoke alarms shall not opply to one-family and two-family 

dwellings undergoing alterations, repairs or additions. Non-interconnected battery operated smoke alarms shall 

be installed in these dwellings . 

• 

Section R325.5 Mezzanines (Openness) 

The PA UCC RAC amended this section by eliminating Exception #2, crossed out: 

■ Mezzanines shall be open and unobstructed to the room in which they are located except far walls not more 

than 36 inches (914 mm) in height, columns and posts. 

Exceptions: 

1. Mezzanines or portions thereof are not required to be open to the room in which they are located, provided tilot 

FLOODPtfi~~!'~~~"tTd~Ttl'?~t"'b'NNli'iPc!)IJrn8'ilP.'tl1:'e9~'Rtf~~~tl¥e9~1\~h0~8PW~,lM~t~h~~1/zzanine area. 
ENERGY coc/E'RESOURCES (/ENERGY-CODE-RESOURCES-AND-TRAINING) ENERGY REsl'LIENCE (/ENERGY-RESILIENCE-RESOURCES) 



cow. 1 t 11101c tlion hoo :,teticJ above 91ade plane emd eeiuipped tl11ou9l1out ooitl1 

BECO~~~~~~l'lfili/!e,c:s.)l!!t<':fll"::if't:<:,e,"'!'<:l<:tl"!e<,-yoli1:h:-5',etjert:R::~~::t'11~"!"rt"'1:~,tt!J::n,:>t-e>e:r:etttttt'<e,t"'1be-op,en 
(HTT /D/E/lFAl~QL ACWFF9F YK98QCHIICIATQGAMWQNI WFORM? 

USP= _ 

"1, LOGIN (/USER?DESTINATION=NODE/14150) ~ NOT A MEMBER? REGISTER (/USER/REGISTER) l!! SHOPPING CART (/CART) (0) 

Section R325.6 Habitable Attics 
(/) 

The PA UCC RAC amended this section by eliminating Item #4, crossed out 

• A habitable attic shall not be considered a story where complying with all of the following requirements; 

1. The occupiable floor area is not less than 70 square feet (17 m2), in accordance with Section R304. 

2. The occupiable floor area has a ceiling height in accordance with Section R305. 

3. The occupiable space is enclosed by the roof assembly above, knee walls (if applicable) on the sides and the floor­

ceiling assembly below. 

4. Tl,e floor of tt,e oee~pioble spoee sl ,oil not eictend beyond ti ,e exterior \',oils of the floor belo,v. 

Section R408.3 Unvented Crawl Spaces 

The PA UCC RAC amended this section by eliminating Item 2.4 and replacing it with a new section 2.4: 

• Ventilation openings in under-floor spaces specified in Sections R408.1 and R408.2 shall not be required where 

the following items are provided; 

• 

■ l. Exposed earth is covered with a continuous Class I vapor retarder. Joints of the vapor retarder 

shall overlap by 6 inches (152 mm) and shall be sealed or taped. The edges of the vapor retarder 

shall extend not less than 6 inches (152 mm) up the stem wall and shall be attached and sealed to 

the stem wall or insulation. 

■ 2. One of the following is provided for the under-floor space: 

■ 2.1. Continuously operated mechanical exhaust ventilation at a rate equal to 1 cubic foot 

per minute (0.47 L/s) for each 50 square feet (4.7 m2) of crawl space floor area. including an 

air pathway to the common area (such as a duct or transfer grille). and perimeter walls 

insulated in accordance with Section N1102.2.ll of this code. 

FLOODPLAIN MANAGEMENT (HTTPS://WWW.PACONSTRUCTIONCODESACADEMY.ORG/FLOODPLAIN-MANAGEMENT) 

ENERGY CODE RESOURCES (/ENERGY-CODE-RESOURCES-AND-TRAINING) ENERGY RESILIENCE (/ENERGY-RESILIENCE-RESOURCES) 



CONTACT (/CONTACT) ■ 2.2. Conditioned air supply sized to deliver at o rate equal to 1 cubic foot per minute (0.47 

BECOME A PCCA INSTRUCTORL/sl for each 50 square feet (4.7 m2l of under-floor area, includinq a return air pathway to 
(HTTPS://DOCS.GOOGLE.COM/FQRMS/D/E/1FAIPQLSEGGM::l,'.CQC9XAdMCIQYINPG5ACWFF9F_YK98QCHIK..IATQGAMWQNJEWFORM? 
USP=SF_LINK) the common area (sue,, as a uct or transfer grille), and perimeter walls insulated in 

'1, LOGIN (/USER?DESTINATION=OO!lPf:Aq!51jje witr(ieJQti~I'\ ~i2R1d1S1%~~~~EGISTER) l!! SHOPPING CART (/CART) (0) 

(/) ■ 2.3. Plenum in existing structures complying with Section M1601.5, if under-floor space is used as a 

plenum. 

■ 2.4 Del;un 1ielifieatia1, sieceel ta i:,ra11iele 70 i:,il'lts (33 lite1 s) of M ,aistu, e I e, MO,al i:,e, ela) far e,el') 1,000 

seiua,e feet (93 ,'1'12) of era11,I si:,aee flea, area. 

■ Replace 2.4 with: 2.4. Dehumidification sized in accordance with manufacturer's specifications. 

Sections R602.10- 602.10.10.3 of the 2018 !RC in their entirety have been replaced: 

Act 1 of 2011 legislatively amended Section 901 (i) of Act 45 of 1999 PA Construction Code Act 

i. Wall bracing requirements. --Sections R602.10 through R602.12.1.6 of the 2009 International Residential Code, 

or its successor provisions, are excluded from the Uniform Construction Code. The wall bracing requirements of 

sections R602.10 through R602.11.3 of the 2006 International Residential Code shall be part of the Uniform 

Construction Code. 

++++++++++++++++++++++++++++++++++++++++++++++++++ 

■ R7027.3 Vented Cladding 

■ PA UCC RAC modified this section by adding a comma that was neglected in the publication af the !RC 

■ Inserted a comma between the wards "vinyl" and "polypropylene": 

• For the purposes of this section, vented cladding shall include the following minimum clear airspaces. 

Other openings with the equivalent vent area shall be permitted. 

• Vinyl, polypropylene or horizontal aluminum siding applied over a weather-resistive barrier as specified in 

Table R703.3(1). 

■ Brick veneer with a clear airspace as specified in Table R703.8.4. 

■ Other approved vented claddings. 

FLOODPLAIN MANAGEMENT (HTTPS://WWW.PACONSTRUCTIONCODESACADEMY.ORG/FLOODPLAIN-MANAGEMENTJ 
ENERGY CODE RESOURCES (/ENERGY-CODE-RESOURCES-AND-TRAINING) ENERGY RESILIENCE (/ENERGY-RESILIENCE-RESOURCES) 



R7l9l&rl'A@ttlii<ilbtT~ster (stucco) [Delete this section from the 2018 IRC and replace it with the following section from 
th~~ ~A INSTRUCTOR 

(HTTPS://DOCJi.GOOGLE.COM/FORMS/D/E/1FAIPQLSEGGM_VCQC9XAMCIQYWPG5ACWFF9F_YK98QCHll<-IATQGAMWQNIEWFORM? 

USP=SF_LINK) 

17lGl:.iN~m1~d~1141so1 ~ NOT A MEMBER? REGISTER (/USER/REGISTER) l!: SHOPPING CART I/CART) (0) 

• Installation of exterior plaster shall be in compliance with ASTM C926-20188, ASTM (1063-20188 and the 

(/) provisions of this code. 

R703.7.l Lath [Delete this section from the 2018 IRC and replace it with the following section from the 2021 IRq: = 
• Lath and lath attachments shall be of corrosion-resistant materials in accordance with ASTM C1063-20188. 

Expanded metal, welded wire, or woven wire lath shall be attached to wood framing members or furring. 

Where the exterior plaster is serving as wall bracing in accordonce with Table R602.10.4, the lath shall be 

attached directly to framing. The lath shall be attached with 1-1/2-inch-long, 11-gage nails having a 7/16 -inch 

head, or 7/8 -inch-long, 16-gage staples, spaced not more than 7 inches on center along framing members or 

furring and not more than 24 inches on center between framing members or furring, or as otherwise approved. 

• Additional fastening between wood framing members shall not be prohibited. Lath attachments to cold-formed 

steel framing orto masonry, stone, or concrete substrates shall be in accordance with ASTM C1063-20188. 

Where lath is installed directly over foam sheathing, lath connections shall also be in accordance with Section 

R703.15, R703.16 or R703.17. Where lath is attached to furring installed over foam sheathing, the furring 

connections shall be in accordance with Section R703.15, R703.16 or R703.17. 

o Exception: Lath is not required over masonry, cast-in-place concrete, precast concrete or stone substrates 

prepared in accordance with ASTM (1063-20188. 

• 703.7.1.1 Furring. Where provided, furring shall consist of wood furring strips not less than 1 inch by 2 inches 

(25 mm by 51 mm), minimum 3/4-inch (19 mm) metal channels, or self-furring lath, and shall be installed in 

accordance with ASTM C1063-20188. Furring shall be spaced not greater than 24 inches (600 mm) on center 

and, where installed over wood or cold-formed steel framing, shall be fastened into framing members. 

R703.7.2 Plaster [Delete this section from the 2018 IRC and replace it with the following section from the 20211Rq: 

• Plastering with cement plaster shall be in accordance with ASTM (926-20188. Cement materials shall be in 

accordance with one of the following: 

1. Masonry cement conforming to ASTM C91-2018A, Type M, Sar N. 

2. Portland cement conforming to ASTM (150-2018, Type I, II or Ill. 

3. Blended hydraulic cement conforming to ASTM (595-2018, Type IP, IS(< 70), IL, or IT (S < 70). 

4. Hydraulic cement conforming to ASTM C1157-11, Type GU, HE, MS, 

HS or MH. 

5. Plastic (stucco) cement conforming to ASTM C1328-12. 

FLOODPLAIN MANAGEMENT (HTTPS://WWW.PACONSTRUCTIONCODESACADEMY.ORG/FLOODPLAIN-MANAGEMENT) 

ENERGY CODE RESOURCES (/ENERGY-CODE-RESOURCES-AND-TRAINING) ENERGY RESILIENCE (/ENERGY-RESILIENCE-RESOURCES) 



CON~si!eP~TAflTbe not less than three coats where applied over metal lath or wire lath and shall be not less than 

BEcow;& ~55N~Hl!l~T/i'/lplied over masonry, concrete, pressure preservative-treated wood or decay-resistant wood 
(HTTPS://DOCS,G.OOGLE.COM/fORMS/D/!;/lFAIPQLSEGGM VCQ<;9XAMCIQYWPGSACWFF~F_YK~BQCHIIUATQGAMWQNIEWFORM? 
USP=st:ciRl.;c11ied In Section R317.1 or gypsum backing. If Hie plaster surtace Is completely covered by veneer or 

Iii LOGl~~M1tfmiiruJ1~<§1!iiil!l-'IP3lllPletela~~l1;1liMSW!lMt®12~qllti11R11Wlgm~ only tf!fo~~r!)Nm<j/t,i,i'l'! ~(l)l:al 

thickness is as set forth in Table R702.1(1). 

(/) 

• On wood-frame construction with an on-grade floor slab system, exterior plaster shall be applied to cover, but 

not extend below, lath, paper and screed. 

• The proportion of aggregate to cementitious materials shall be as set forth in Table R702.1(3). 

R703.7.3 Water Resistive Barriers [Delete this section from the 2018 IRC and replace it with the following section from 
the 2021 IRC]: 

R703.7 .3 Water-resistive barriers 

• Water-resistive barriers shall be installed as required in Section R703.2 and, where applied over wood-based 

sheathing, shall comply with Section R703.7.3.1 or R703.7.3.2. 

R703.7.3.1 Dry climates 

• In Dry (B) climate zones indicated in Figure N1101.7, water-resistive barriers shall comply with one of the 

following: (there are no dry climate zones in Pennsylvania) 

• 1. The water-resistive barrier shall be two layers of 10-minute Grode D paper or have a water resistance equal 

to or greater than two layers of a water-resistive barrier complying with ASTM E2556-10, Type I. The individual 

layers shall be installed independently such that each layer provides a separate continuous plane. Flashing 

installed in accordance with Section R703.4 and intended to drain to the water-resistive barrier shall be directed 

between the layers. 

• 2. The water-resistive barrier shall be 60-minute Grade D paper or have a water resistance equal to or greater 

than one layer of a water-resistive barrier complying with ASTM E2556-10, Type II. The water-resistive barrier 

shall be separated from the stucco by a layer of foam plastic insulating sheathing or other non-water-absorbing 

layer, or a designed drainage space. 

R703.7,3.2 Moist or marine climates 

• In the Moist (A) or Marine (C) climate zones indicated in Figure Nll0l.7, water-resistive barriers shall comply 

with one of the following: (Pennsylvania is a moist climate zone) 

FLOODPLAIN MANAGEMENT (HTTPS://WWW.PACONSTRUCTIONCODESACADEMY.ORG/FLOODPLAIN-MANAGEMENT) 
ENERGY CODE RESOURCES (/ENERGY-CODE-RESOURCES-AND-TRAINING) ENERGY RESILIENCE (/ENERGY-RESILIENCE-RESOURCES) 



CONT,1,\:fr{/fi\;llfil'\&Jto complying with Section R703.7.3.1, a space or drainage material not less than 3/16 inch (5 mm) 

BECOtf1,Etf'.Frttffi/f'/aT/W~1\tfued to the exterior side of the water-resistive barrier. 
(HTTPS:/ioocs.GOOGLE.COM/FORMS/0/E/1FAIPQLSEGGM_VCQC9XAMCIQYWPG5ACWFF9F_YK9BQCHIK_IATQGAMWQNIEWFORM7 
USP=SF _LINK) 

'1, LOGIN (/USER?DESTINATION=NODE/14150) [A' NOT A MEMBER? REGISTER (/USER/REGISTER) l!! SHOPPING CART (/CART) (0) 

(/) 

• 2. In addition to complying with Section R703. 7.3.1, Item 2, drainage on the exterior of the water-resistive 

barrier shall have a drainage efficiency of not less than 90 percent, as measured in accordance with ASTM 

E2273-2018 or Annex A2 of ASTM E2925-17. 

R806.1 Ventilation required. 

■ The PA UCC RAC amended this section as reflected by the wards crossed out: 
■ Enclosed attics and enclosed rafter spaces formed where ceilings are applied directly to the underside of roof 

rafters shall have cross ventilation for each separate space by ventilating openings protected against the 

entrance of rain or snow. Ventilation openings shall have a least dimension of 1/16 inch minimum and 1/4-inch 

maximum. Ventilation openings having a least dimension larger than 1/4 inch shall be provided with corrosion­

resistant wire cloth screening, hardware cloth, perforated vinyl or similar material with openings having a least 

dimension of 1/16 inch minimum and 1/4-inch maximum. 

■ Openings in roof framing members shall conform to the requirements of Section R802.7. Required ventilation 

openings shall open directly to the outside air. einel sl.e,11 be r,, eteel:eel te I'' e,e11Hl.e e1;t1 ~ of bit•els, 1 aele1;ts, 

sr,akes a1 ,el otl 1e1 sir-1,ileir ei eatu1 es. 

R806.2 Minimum Vent Area [Delete this section in the 2018 IRC and replace it with this section from the 2015 IRQ: 

■ Exception: The minimum net free ventilation area shall be 1/300 of the vented space provided one or more of the 

following conditions are met: 

1. In Climate Zones 6, 7 and 8, a Class I or II vapor retarder is installed on the warm-in-winter side of the 

ceiling. 

2. Not less than 40 percent and not more than 50 percent of the required ventilating area is provided by 

ventilators located in the upper portion of the attic or rafter space. Upper ventilators shall be located not 

more than 3 feet below the ridge or highest point of the space, measured vertically, with the balance of 

the required ventilation provided by eave or cornice vents. Where the location of wall or roof framing 

members conflicts with the installation of upper ventilators, installation more than 3 feet below the ridge 

or highest point of the space shall be permitted. 

FLOODPLAIN MANAGEMENT (HTTPS://WWW.PACONSTRUCTIONCODESACADEMY.ORG/FLOODPLAIN-MANAGEMENT) 
ENERGY CODE RESOURCES (/ENERGY-CODE-RESOURCES-AND-TRAINING) ENERGY RESILIENCE (/ENERGY-RESILIENCE-RESOURCES) 



(Tl'i@~rnlrm!Nife!qilllres that both conditions are met. By maintaining the 2015 language, only one condition must be 

mm't8~1fi1Fffi~ ~~\W 
(HTTPS://DOCS.GOOGi:f.i:'oM/FORMS/D/E/1FAIPQLSEGGM_VCQC9XAMCIQYWPG5ACWFF9F_YK9BQCHIK.JATQGAMWQNIEWFORM? 

USP=SF _LINK) 

Iii LOGIN (/USER?DESTINATION=NODE/14150) 

R806.3 Vent and insulation clearance 

(/) 

(? NOT A MEMBER? REGISTER (/USER/REGISTER) 

The PA UCC RAC amended this section as reflected by the words crossed out: 

l!! SHOPPING CART (/CART) (0) 

• Where eave or cornice vents are installed, bleeki119, b1 id9il ,g ai,d ir,sulatie,, nothing shall ftet block the free flow 

of air. Not less than a 1-inch space shall be provided between the insulation and the roof sheathing and at the 

location of the vent. 

M1005.8 Insulation Shield 

The PA UCC DID NOT ADOPT THIS PROVISION: 

■ \A./he1 e fael:01 y built chil 1111e)J pess tfwougl, i1131:1/atcel a3ser11blie3, a1, insulatia,, sl,idd ea113tl t1et:ed af steel 

I ,a oit,9 a ti 1iek11cJs of 1,ot less ti 101, ~Jo. 26 gage JI ,all be i1 ,stalled to pt ooicle elcoi a1 ,cc betvvee11 ti ,e el 1i11.1,cy 011d 

ti 1e h 1stJ!otio11 111ote1 ial. 

■ \a.Jhc1 e chin,1 ,eys 1-3ass tl=11 ougl, ot-t:ic space, tMe sl ,ielel JI 1all tc11, ii1=iatc 1=iet less ti ,e!fl 2 i1,el ,e:3 abe./e tl=ie ir=isulatioFI 

1, 1etc1 ials and shell be seetn=cd ii, place to pt cvct 1t dis1-3laee1; 1211t. l11suletie11 sl ,ielcfa pro'vieleel as pert ef a listed 

cl 1il"lil ,ey 5'.,3tet,, shall be ii ,stalleel ii, aeeorele11"lee vvith ti ,e MIi. 

{However, the identical provision WAS ADOPTED for fuel gas appliances) 

N1101.4 Above code programs [Delete this section in the 2018 IRC and replace it with this Section N1101.8 from the 
2009 IRq: 

■ The building official or other authority having jurisdiction shall be permitted to deem a national, state or local 

energy efficiency program to exceed the energy efficiency required by this chapter. 

■ Buildings approved in writing by such an energy efficiency program shall be considered in compliance with ~s 
FLOODPl:flll:/~~AGEMENT (HTTPS://WWW.PACONSTRUCTIONCODESACADEMY.ORG/FLOODPLAIN-MANAGEMENT) 

ENERGY c5□E RESOURCES (/ENERGY-CODE-RESOURCES-AND-TRAINING) ENERGY RESILIENCE (/ENERGY-RESILIENCE-RESOURCES) 



CONTACT (/CONTACT) 

BECOME A PCCA INSTRUCTOR 

(HTTPS://DOCS.GOOGLE.COM/FORMS/D/E/1FAIPQLSEGGM_VCQC9XAMCIQYWPG5ACWFF9F_YK9BQCHIK.JATQGAMWQNIEWFORM7 

USP=SF _LINK) 

Q LOGIN (/USERlDESTINATION=NODE/14150) ~ NOT A MEMBER) REGISTER (/USER/REGISTER) "}!! SHOPPING CART (/CART) (0) 

N1103.3.5 Building Cavities [Delete this section in the 2018 IRC and replace it with Section N1103.5.2 from the 2009 
IRq: 

(/) 

■ F1e1111il1~ cavities eaii11et be used as duets a1 ~lenum.s. 

■ Building framing cavities shall not be used as supply ducts. 

N1105.2 Mandatory requirements- Simulated Performance Alternative [Delete this section in the 2018 IRC and replace 
it with this Section N1105.2 from the 2015 IRq: 

■ Compliance with this section requires that the mandatory provisions identified in Section N1101.13 (of the 2015 

IRC) be met. All supply and return ducts not completely inside the building thermal envelope shall be insulated 

to a minimum of R-6. 

N1105.4.2 Compliance report [Delete this section in the 2018 IRC and replace it with this Section N1105.4.2 from the 
2015IRq: 

■ Compliance software tools shall generate a report that documents that the proposed design complies with 

Section N 1105.3. A compliance report on the proposed design shall be submitted with the application for the 

building permit. Upon completion of the building, a compliance report based on the as-built condition of the 

building shall be submitted to the code official before a certificate of occupancy is issued. Batch sampling of 

buildings to determine energy code compliance for all buildings in the batch shall be prohibited. 

N 1106.3 Energy rating index [Delete this section in the 2018 IRC and replace it with this Section N 1106.3 from the 

2015 IRq: 

FLOODPLAIN MANAGEMENT (HTTPS://WWW.PACONSTRUCTIONCODESACADEMY.ORG/FLOODPLAIN-MANAGEMENT) 

ENERGY CODE RESOURCES (/ENERGY-CODE-RESOURCES-AND-TRAINING) ENERGY RESILIENCE (/ENERGY-RESILIENCE-RESOURCES) 



CONTACT l"COJ'ffo!-<ffmergy Rating Index (ERi) shall be a numerical integer value that is based on a linear scale 

BECOME A PCEl)/M.t,f~l:\!e'"d'~uch that the ERi reference desiqn has an Index value of 100 and a residential building that 
(HTTPS://DOCS,GOOGLE.COM/FORMS/D/E/1FAIPQLSE;GGM_VCQC9XAt,;lCIQYWPGS~WFF9F_YK9BQCHIK_IATQGAMWQNIEWFQRM? 
USP=SF_LINK)uses no net purchased energy has an Index value of 0. Each integer value on the scale shall represent a 1 

,Iii LOGIN (/USEFmlE~1!11W1~fMt!;l9od>'ll,il;i~tal e~~~~tJill~~~iB!)S~/Atil!l'~-tg,1he tot,ij ElJ\lfilen(~~~i:ili)l101 

reference design. The ERi shall consider oll energy used in the residential building. 

N1106.3.1 ERi reference design - insert this Section from the 2015 IRC. This does not specifically replace a section in 
tile 2018 IRC (reference design is included as part o N1106.3 in 2018 IRC, which has been deleted by the UCC RAC 

• The ERi reference design shall be configured such that it meets the minimum requirements of the 2006 

International Energy Conservation Code prescriptive requirements. The proposed residential building shall be 

shown to have an annual total normalized modified load less than or equal to the annual total loads of the ERi 

reference design. 

N1106.6.1 Compliance software tools [Delete this section in the 2018 IRC and replace it with this Section N1106.6.1 

from the 2015 IRq: 

• Documentation verifying that the methods and accuracy of the compliance software tools conform to the 

provisions of this section shall be provided to the code official. 

N1106.6.4 Specific approval [Delete this section in the 2018 IRC and replace it with Section N1106.7.2 from the 2015 
IRq: 

■ Performance analysis tools meeting the applicable sections of Section N1106 shall be approved. Tools are 

permitted to be approved based on meeting a specified threshold for a jurisdiction. 

■ The code official shall approve tools for a specified application or limited scope. 

N1106.6.5 Input values [Delete this section in the 2018 IRC and replace it with this Section N1106.3.1 from the 2015 
IRq: 

■ When calculations require input values not specified by Sections N1102, N1103, N1104 and N1105, those input 

values shall be taken from an approved source. 

■ Calculation software, where used, shall be in accordance with Sections N1106.7.1 through N1106.7.3. 

■ N1106.7 Calculation software tools -insert this section from the 2015 IRC. This section does not exist in the 
2018IRC 

N1106.7.1 Minimum capabilities - insert this section from the 2015 IRC. This section does not exist in the 2018 IRC: 
A 

FLOODPLAIN MANAGEMENT (HTTPS://WWW.PACONSTRUCTIONCODESACADEMY.ORG/FLOODPLAIN-MANAGEMENTI 
ENERGY CODE RESOURCES (/ENERGY-CODE-RESOURCES-AND-TRAINING) ENERGY RESILIENCE 1/ENERGY-RESILIENCE-RESOURCESI 



C~T®1d&l@fITTM:1!rocedures used to comply with this section shall be software tools capable of calculating the ERi as 

BECOM~£c~ftl?t/Wi~&T8~ N1106.3, and shall include the followinq capabilities: 
(HTTPS://D0CS.GOOGLE.COM/FORMS/D/E/1FAIPQLSEGGM_VCQC9XAMCIQYWPG'5ACWFF9F_YK98QCHIK..JATQGAMWQNIEWF0RM? 

USP=SF_LINK) 1. Computer generation of the ERi reference design using only 
,!. LOGIN {/USER?DESTll\lfiATION=NtODE/l4150lt d d f7. NOT A MEMBER? REGISTER {/USER/REGISTER) l!! SHOPPING CART (/CART) (0) 

t e 1npu ror me ra e es1gn. 

The calculation procedure shall not allow the user to 

!:iliaracteristics of the ERi reference design. 

directly modify the building component 

2. Calculation of whole-building, as a single zone, sizing for the heating and cooling equipment in the ERi reference 

design residence in accordance with Section N1103.7. 

3. Calculations that account for the effects of indoor and outdoor temperatures and part-load ratios on the 

performance of heating, ventilating and air-conditioning equipment based on climate and equipment sizing. 

4. Printed code official inspection checklist listing each of the rated design component characteristics determined by 

the analysis to provide compliance, along with their respective performance ratings 

N1108.1.1.2 Heating and cooling systems [Delete this section in the 2018 IRC and replace it with this section from the 

20151Rq: 

• New heating, cooling and duct systems that are part of the addition shall comply with Sections N1103.1, 

N1103.2, N1103.3, N1103.5 and N1103.6. 

• Exception: Where ducts from an existing heating and cooling system are extended to an 

addition, duct systems with less than 40 linear feet in unconditioned spaces shall not be 

required to be tested in accordance with Section N1103.2.2. 

N1109.1.2 Heating and cooling systems [Delete this section in the 2018 IRC and replace it with this section from the 
2015 IRq: 

M1201.1 Scope 

• New heating, cooling and duct systems that are part of the alteration shall comply with Sections 

N1103.1. N1103.2, N1103.3, N1103.5 and N1103.6. 

• Exception: Where ducts from an existing heating and cooling system are extended, duct 

systems with less than 40 linear feet in unconditioned spaces shall not be required to be 

tested in accordance with Section N1103.2.2. 

FLOODP~~~ (mi'l:l!t.~11i\coi\~~~tl~im;AcADEMY.ORG/FLOODPLAIN-MANAGEMENT) 
ENERGY CODE RESOURCES (/ENERGY-CODE-RESOURCES-AND-TRAINING) ENERGY RESILIENCE (/ENERGY-RESILIENCE-RESOURCES) 



MJ;JWM~{!Q<lrechanical Installations 
BECOME A PCCA INSTRUCTOR 

(HTTPS:/IDOCS,GO()GLE.COM/FQRMS/D/E/1F;\IPQLSoG(iM_VCQC9XAMCIQYWPG5ACWFF9F_YK9BQCHIIUATQGAMWQNIEWFORM? 
USP=,!;!~l!WJ entire subsection - Act 92 excIus10n 

,Iii LOGIN (/USER?DESTINATION=NODE/14150) (,? NOT A MEMBER? REGISTER (/USER/REGISTER) lJ!i' SHOPPING CART (/CART) (0) 

M1305.1.3.2 Pit Locations [Delete this section in the 2018 IRC and replace it with this section from the 2015 IRq: 

(/) • M 1305.1.4.2 Excavations 

• Excavations for appliance installations shall extend to a depth of 6 inches below the appliance and 12 inches'i:Jn 

all sides, except that the control side shall have a clearance of 30 inches 

M 1411.6.1 Refrigerant line insulation protection [Delete this section in the 2018 IRC and replace it with this PA UCC 
RAC Modification from the 2021 IRq: 

• Refrigerant piping insulation shall be protected in accordance with Section N1103.4.1. 

M1502.3.1 Exhaust Termination Outlet and Passageway Size (Dryer Exhaust Ducts) [Delete this section in the 2018 
IRC and do not replace it anything - it was not adopted by the PA UCC RAC) 

• Tl ,e possa9evooy of d1 ye1 exhoust duet tc1111i1 ,als sholl be u11di11ii1,i3I ,cd i11 3jzc e.111d sl 1all p1 ovide 011 o~et, 01 co 

of I 1ot le:33 ti.al I 12.5 3eJUOI e ii ,cl if.3. 

tHowever, the identical provision WAS ADOPTED for fuel gas fired clothes dryers) 

M1801.3 Existing Chimneys and Vents 

Delete entire subsection -Act 92 exclusion 

M2001.1.1 Standards for boilers 

By legislative amendment: 

Coal fired boilers are not required to comply with the ASME stamping requirements. 

FLOODPLAIN MANAGEMENT (HTTPS://WWW.PACONSTRUCTIONCODESACADEMY.ORG/FLOODPLAIN-MANAGEMENT) 

ENERGY CODE RESOURCES (/ENERGY-CODE-RESOURCES-AND-TRAINING) ENERGY RESILIENCE (/ENERGY-RESILIENCE-RESOURCES) 



G~Rll!p(!iifACTJ 
BECOME A PCCA INSTRUCTOR 

(HTTPS://DOCS,GOPGLE.COM/FQRMS/0/E/1FA!PQLSl;'GG_M.VCQC9XAMCIQYWPGSACWFF9F_YK9BQCHIK.JATQGAMWQNIEWFORM? 
USP=,9~~ entire subsection - Act 92 exclusion 

Q LOGIN (/USER?DESTINATION=NODE/14150) [? NOT A MEMBER? REGISTER (/USER/REGISTER) l!! SHOPPING CART (/CART) (OJ 

~f503.5.1 Rough Plumbing - DWV Testing [Delete this section in the 2018 IRC and replace it with this Section 
P2503.5.1 from the 2009 IRq: _ 

• DWV systems shall be tested on completion of the rough piping installation by water ar air without evidence of 

leakage 

P2903.5 Water Hammer 

[Delete the 2018 IRC language, and replace with Section P2903.5 of the 2015 IRC: 

• The flow velocity of the water distribution system shall be controlled to reduce the possibility of water hammer. 

• Water-hammer arrestors shall be installed in accordance with the manufacturer's instructions. Water-hammer 

arrestors shall conform to ASSE 1010. 

P2503.5.1 Rough Plumbing - DWV Testing [Delete this section in the 2018 IRC and replace it with this Section 
P2503.5.1 from the 2009 IRq: 

• DWV systems shall be tested on completion of the rough piping installation by water ar air without evidence of 

leakage 

P2906.6.1 Prohibited Joints 

The PA UCC RAC modified this section by NOT ADOPTING #6 prohibited joints - saddle tap fittings 

The following types of joints and connections shall be prohibited: 

6. Soddle type fittiM9s. 

Therefore, saddle tap fittings are allowed 

E3901.11 Electrical Receptacles - Foyers 
FLOODPLAIN MANAGEMENT (HTTPS://WWW.PACONSTRUCTIONCODESACAOEMY.DRG/FLOOOPLAIN-MANAGEMENT) 

ENERGY CODE RESOURCES (/ENERGY-CODE-RESOURCES-AND-TRAINING) ENERGY RESILIENCE (/ENERGY-RESILIENCE-RESOURCES) 



T~ls:lllllffiCfflodified this section as noted in bold, underline: 
BECOME A PCCA INSTRUCTOR 

(HTTP\\(/DOCS.GOOGLE.COM/FORMS/D/E/1FAIPQLSEGGM_VCQC9XAMCIQYWPG5ACWFF9F YK9BQl;HIKJATQGAMWQN1EWFORM7 
F°0'SP~5F~EINl<fe not part of a hallway in accordonce with Section E3901.10 (https://up.codes/v1ewer/kansas/1rc-

fi]ik§Vml:l11g~~fp1'!fWb/jgq:\ifl{lltdistri~i~o#li~l;\l!@.~Gri!~~IROO~ thatl!!!9$~@mi'lb'<l~ll'iGm"li;n:irt1l1feet 
shall have a receptocle(s) located in each wall space that is 3 6 feet or more in width, [ADD]: but a minimum of 1 
receptacle 

(/) 
Doorways, door-side windows that extend to the floor, and similar openings shall not be considered as wall space= 

CALENDAR 

Floodplain Ordinance Training (8-16-2022) (/floodplain-ordinance-training-8-16-2022) 

Tuesday,August16,2022 

REGISTER! (/FLOODPLAIN-ORDINANCE-TRAINING-8-16-2022) 

LINKS 

• About (/about) 

• Training & Certification (/training-certification) 

• Courses (/courses) 

• Resources (http:/,paconstructioncodesacademy.org/resources) 

• FAQs (/general-faqs) 

ABOUT US 

PCCA's mission is to provide professional development to code officials through certification and continuing 

education training by offering multi-formatted sessions and operating a clearing house of information relevant to 

additional educational opportunities. 

CONTACT US 

PCCA, 414 N 2nd Street, Harrisburg, PA 17101 

\. 717-236-9469 

" FLOODPLAIN ~ft\i~@ifcl'E8&1'1-M\!f/ar~~@~ji,N2/ltt\,:OO'e/f/nl5lils'lt@j!r~tm11ihcodesacademy.org) 
ENERGY CODE RESOURCES (/ENERGY-CODE-RESOURCES-AND-TRAINING) ENERGY RESILIENCE (/ENERGY-RESILIENCE-RESOURCES) 



C~ACT (/CONJ:bCT) . 
s~ME A ~fcl),.,1~¥TRGE.PBi¥ S:OO AM - 4:3o PM 
(HTTPS://DOCS.GOOGLE.COM/FORMS/D/E/1FAIPQLSEGGM_vcqcgXAMCIQYWPGSACWFF9F _YK98QCHIIUATQGAMWQNIEWFORMI 

USP=SF _LINK) 

jjl LOGIN (/USER?DESTINATION=NODE/14150) ~ NOT A MEMBER? REGISTER (/USER/REGISTER) 'J!!! SHOPPING CART (/CART) (0) 

(/) 

Copyright© 2022 PCCA I All Rights Reserved 

@ 
(//www.linkedin.com/company/pa­

construction-

(D@ codes­

(//wwWtw~ade~derimylcodesacademy) 


